


Can you see a parrot on a 
giraffe?

Can you see a parrot in front 
of a bear?

Can you see a bird next to a 
parrot?

Can you see a bird behind a 
goat?

Can you see a giraffe behind a 
hippo?

Can you see a giraffe between 
a fox and a chick?

Can you see a zebra behind a 
giraffe?

Can you see a zebra next to a 
snake?

Can you see an elephant in 
front of a kangaroo?

Can you see an elephant 
behind a bird?



Can you see a panda on an 
elephant?

Can you see a panda under a 
tiger?

Can you see a kangaroo 
behind an elephant?

Can you see a kangaroo next 
to a hippo?

Can you see a sheep next to a 
kangaroo?

Can you see a sheep between 
an insect and a frog?

Can you see a snake in front 
of a sheep?

Can you see a snake behind a 
horse?

Can you see a bear next to a 
chick??

Can you see a bear on a 
giraffe?



Can you see a chick under a 
bear?

Can you see a chick in a 
snake?

Can you see a fox behind a 
dog?

Can you see a fox next to a 
zebra?

Can you see a rabbit between 
a fox and a horse?

Can you see a rabbit in front 
of a turtle?

Can you see a horse behind a 
tiger?

Can you see a horse next to a 
panda?

Can you see a frog on a 
horse?

Can you see a frog under a 
dog?



Can you see a hippo next to a 
lion?

Can you see a hippo in front 
of a snake?

Can you see a cat on a hippo? Can you see a cat under a 
kangaroo?

Can you see a lion next to a 
horse?

Can you see a lion behind an 
elephant?

Can you see an insect on a 
lion?

Can you see an insect in a 
duck?

Can you see a tiger behind a 
goat?

Can you see a tiger behind a 
bear?



Can you see a goat in front of 
a tiger?

Can you see a goat under a 
panda?

Can you see a dog between a 
bear and a turtle?

Can you see a dog behind a 
lion?

Can you see a duck behind a 
monkey?

Can you see a duck under a 
hippo?

Can you see a monkey next to 
a turtle?

Can you see a monkey next to 
a cat?

Can you see a turtle next to a 
monkey?

Can you see a turtle between 
a horse and a hippo?


