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⚫ Summer is the greatest time for all of 
students. It is time to relax and do what 
you want.



⚫ But some students are faced with a 
“problem” like practice. Because at first I 
want to tall about my summer practice on 
camp “Polyanka”.



⚫ It was interesting time for me and my 
friends. Together we lived a month in the 
countryside.





⚫ At the beginning we caught various 
insects. How many beautiful beetles and 
butterflies we are surrounded by every 
day.





⚫ Results of our work:



⚫ Next time we were engaged in botany. 
Every morning we went on excursions and 
collected some plants for herbarium.





⚫ Going to the forest was the most 
interesting and exciting. Huge trees stood 
like the kings of these place.



⚫ Besides studing we rested and had fun 
together. Practice made us very close.





⚫ The second part of summer I stayed at 
home with my family. All days I spent 
time with my little sisters, walked and 
played with them.





⚫ Together with my family we went to the 
Konstantinovo and Poschupovo, visited 
the museum S. Esenin.





⚫ In august I watched the starfall. It is so 
amazing! I even managed to make a wish.



⚫ This summer was fulled with pleasant 
moments and it will remain forever in my 
memory.




